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Background: Australia has seen a resurgence in infectious and congenital syphilis 
in the Aboriginal and Torres Strait Islander (Indigenous) population. Early detection 
and treatment of syphilis in pregnancy is essential for the health of the mother, to 
prevent adverse pregnancy outcomes and to prevent transmission to the infant.  The 
aim of this study was to explore the extent of antenatal screening for syphilis and 
other sexually transmitted infections (STIs) and blood borne viruses (BBVs) in 
Indigenous primary health care (PHC) centres, and client and health centre 
characteristics associated with variation in screening practices.  
 
Methods: Maternal health records (n= 4399) were audited at 91 Indigenous PHC 
centres across five Australian States, 2007 - 2014.  Data were collected on 
demographic characteristics and documented provision of antenatal care. 
Descriptive analyses assessed the frequency of screening for syphilis and other STIs 
and BBVs including chlamydia/gonorrhoea, hepatitis B and HIV. Multilevel logistic 
regression was undertaken to quantify the variation in screening attributable to 
health centre and client characteristics. 
 
Results: Screening for syphilis was documented for 88% of women (range across 
jurisdictions 74-96%). Syphilis testing rates increased from 73.9% in 2007 to 95.4% 
in 2014 and with CQI cycle (80.6% at baseline to 92.6% at three or more cycles). 
Aboriginal community-controlled centres had slightly lower rates of screening for 
syphilis (85% vs 89%), compared with government-run centres. Syphilis screening 
was independently associated with testing for HIV and other screening tests (full 
blood count, blood group, antibodies and Rubella). 
 
Conclusion: Syphilis screening coverage was high among pregnant women 
attending Indigenous PHC centres but coverage varied across jurisdictions and 
varied with health centre factors.  There is scope to improve antenatal testing for 
syphilis and other STIs and BBVs in health centres. These findings provide evidence 
to guide efforts for service improvement.  
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